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Legal Description:   Lots 40-42, Block 1, Amended Plat of Second Oceanfront Subdivision, as 

recorded in Plat Book 28 at Page 28 of the public records of Miami-Dade 
County, Florida 

 
Year Built: 1947 
 
Original Architect: Henry Hohauser; a master local architect who designed many notable 

structures from the 1930’s to the 1950’s. Within the North Beach 
Resort Historic District, Hohauser designed the Sherry Frontenac Hotel 
in 1947 - Twin 9-story towers with 250 hotel guest rooms, plus 
basement, and 56 cabanas designed in the Post World War 2 modern 
streamline nautical style. 

 
 Outstanding examples of his work also include the Century, Congress, 

Colony, Edison, Park Central (Jose Gomez, AIA, first historic 
preservation project with Les Beilinson Architects, circa 1987); and 
Cardozo Hotels as well as Hoffman's Cafeteria. 

  
Building Description: One of the first great post-war oceanfront hotels to be built within the 

North Beach Resort Historic District.  “The first post-war multi-million 
dollar glamour hostelry”¹. Its interiors and distinctive signage on the 
front façade were designed by Paul Silverthorne. This resort was 
featured in the 1949 issue of Florida Architecture: “The Sherry 
Frontenac was one of the largest and newest hotels on the fabulous 
Gold Coast of Miami Beach, is typical of elaborate tourist 
accommodations. The unusual plan has twin towers 9 stories high on 
each side of the multi-story lobby and gallery and is designed for 
guests who want a deluxe vacation where sun, sand, and surf claim 
most of their time. It’s saw tooth shaped plan permits each of the 
rooms a corner location with maximum sunlight and ocean view … A 
view from the entrance across the lobby and pool to the ocean, is 
enveloped as a natural part of the design of hotel.”² 

 
 The twin towers of the Sherry Frontenac give the illusion of two 

graceful ocean liners complete with smoke stacks, afloat side by side 
at the edge of the Atlantic Ocean. Originally an enclosed metal “gang 
plank” or sky bridge linked them at the top floor until it was removed in 
1980 because the steel structure deteriorated from exposure to the 
elements. 
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 The Sherry Frontenac hotel offered their guests many amenities 

including an expansive elegant 2-story lobby with rich marble and 
stone finishes on the walls, terrazzo floors, and intricate indirect 
lighting which overlooks the ocean, a dining room with a mezzanine 
level orchestra pit, a nightclub, an Olympic size pool and private beach 
cabanas. Guests were greeted with a sweeping porte-cochere when 
they arrived at the hotel. 

 
 “From about 1945 to 1965, the widely popular Post War Modern style 

was frequently applied to hotels, commercial buildings, apartment 
houses, and single family homes throughout Miami Beach, especially 
in North Beach. Post War Modern style buildings generally made an 
extensive use of glass and poured concrete. They often mixed two or 
more textured surfaces together (i.e. stucco with stone, brick, or 
mosaic tile as well as contrasting smooth and fluted stucco surfaces). 
The style featured such dramatic elements as accordion-like folded 
plate walls, acute angles, dynamic parabolas, delta wings, sweeping 
curved walls, and soaring pylons. Other commonly occurring design 
elements and materials that were added to the architectural vocabulary 
of the Post War Modern style structures included: brise soleil, 
architectural accents with exotic themes, brick or stone faced feature 
areas, and cast concrete decorative panels with geometric patterns. 

 
 The large hotels in the Post War Modern style often incorporated an 

expansive use of glass curtain walls, cantilevered asymmetrical roofs, 
leaping arches, dramatic fin walls, floating planes, architectural 
bridges, and grand driveway entrances sheltered by elaborate carport 
structures. Facades were emblazoned with neon signs and logos in 
order to catch the eye of passing motorists. The fenestration was often 
highlighted with boxed, corner, or ribbon windows and continuous 
eyebrows. The hotels often took on exotic or futuristic forms, using 
architecture as· advertising in an effort to outdo one another in 
competing for business. This new architecture celebrated the 
satisfaction of having made it and proudly announced that you had 
arrived.”³ 

 
 Beth Dunlop, a former columnist for the Miami Herald and a past 

member of the City of Miami Beach Historic Preservation Board, 
captured the essence of the Post War Modern architectural movement 
when she wrote: “In the decades after World War II, these were the 
buildings that expressed our ebullience, our energy, our faith in the 
future. They were catchy, kitschy, eccentric, engaging, with loads of 
curbside appeal- our first auto age buildings, really; not to mention 
space age. We were going places then - to the suburbs, to the moon - 
and our buildings told us so. You could see it in roofs that cantilevered 
daringly, in facades that swooped saucily, in towers that took off like a 
Buck Rogers rocket ship, in aerodynamic fins and prows that seemed 
to lift otherwise mundane buildings right off the ground.”4 
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