ITB 2023-422-DF Tabulation

Description

CONCRETE CURBING/SIDEWALK CONSTRUCTION

All Construction &
Plumbing Inc

Metro Express Inc

Team Contracting Inc

1 Remove and Replace 4” Concrete Sidewalk SF S 17.00 $ 5.50 S 7.10
Remove and Replace 4” Concrete Sidewalk. Special
Condition (where no dump truck or container may be
used, i.e. concrete pump), or where concrete trucks
cannot be used and concrete mix is to be done by hand, or
where special conditions such as right of way constraints,
or mechanical, electrical, hand equipment is needed to
2 accomplish the work) SF $ 21.00 $ 7.00 $ 7.30
3 Construct 4” Concrete Sidewalk SF S 12.00 S 5.50 $ 7.10
4 Remove and Replace 6” Concrete Sidewalk SF $ 18.00 $ 6.00 $ 7.30
Remove and Replace 6” Concrete Sidewalk. Special
Condition(where no dump truck or container may be used,
i.e. concrete pump), or where concrete trucks cannot be
used and concrete mix is to be done by hand, or where
special conditions such as right of way constraints, or
mechanical, electrical, hand equipment is needed to
5 accomplish the work) SF S 19.00 $ 7.75 S 7.50
6 Remove and Replace 24”-30” Curb & Gutter LF $ 50.00 $ 30.00 $ 30.00
7 Remove and Replace 36”-42” Curb & Gutter LF S 60.00 $ 35.00 S 35.00
8 Remove and Replace 6” Concrete Curb LF $ 40.00 $ 30.00 $ 20.00
Remove and Replace 24”-30” Concrete Drop Curb, Valley
9 Gutter, Shoulder Gutter, (As per FDOT Index 520-001) LF S 50.00 S 30.00 S 22.00
Remove and Replace 36”-42" Concrete Drop Curb, Valley
10 Gutter, Shoulder Gutter, (As per FDOT Index 520-001) LF $ 60.00 $ 35.00 $ 25.00
Construct New 24”-30” Concrete Drop Curb, Valley Gutter,
11 Shoulder Gutter, (As per FDOT Index 520-001) LF S 50.00 S 30.00 S 20.00
Cast in Place American Disabilities Act (ADA) Mats
12 |Yellow/Gray EA $ 650.00 s 325.00 $ 300.00
13 Surface Applied ADA Mats Yellow/Gray EA $ 650.00 $ 325.00 $ 250.00
14 Construct 4” Concrete Sidewalk SF S 12.00 $ 5.50 S 7.10
Construct 4” Concrete Sidewalk. Special Condition (where
no dump truck or container may be used, i.e. concrete
pump), or where concrete trucks cannot be used and
concrete mix is to be done by hand, or where special
conditions such as right of way constraints, or mechanical,
electrical, hand equipment is needed to accomplish the
15 work) SF S 16.00 S 7.00 S 7.30
16 |Construct 6” Concrete Sidewalk SF S 14.00 S 6.00 $ 7.30
Construct 6” Concrete Sidewalk. Special Condition (where
no dump truck or container may be used, i.e. concrete
pump), or where concrete trucks cannot be used and
concrete mix is to be done by hand, or where special
conditions such as right of way constraints, or mechanical,
electrical, hand equipment is needed to accomplish the
17 work) SF S 16.00 S 7.75 S 7.50
18 Construct 18” Concrete Curb & Gutter LF S 40.00 $ 30.00 S 24.00
19 Construct 24” Concrete Curb & Gutter LF $ 45.00 $ 30.00 $ 26.00
20 Construct 30” Concrete Curb & Gutter LF S 50.00 $ 30.00 S 28.00
21 Construct 6” Concrete Curb LF $ 30.00 $ 30.00 $ 20.00
22 Construct New Pedestrian ADA Ramp (Sub-section. 1.2.5) EA $ 1,800.00 $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00
23 Upcharge for Extra Strength Concrete (4,000 psi) CF S 10.00 S 10.00 S 0.80
24 Addition of Miami Beach Red Coloring Mixture cy $ 10.00 $ 50.00 $ 60.00
25 Pavement Restoration SF $ 5.00 S 10.00 S 4.00
26 Furnish and Install New Pavers SF $ 12.00 $ 15.00 $ 10.00
27 Remove and Reset Existing Pavers SF S 15.00 $ 10.00 S 10.00
28 Remove and Replace Existing Pavers SF $ 18.00 $ 15.00 $ 13.00
29 Remove Existing Pavers SF S 5.00 S 4.00 S 2.00
Place new sod in swale (min. 500sf). FDOT Standard Specs.
30 Section 570 SF S 8.00 $ 1.00 S 2.00
Installation or repair of concrete edge restraints. (Sub-
31 |section 1.2.11) LF $ 30.00 S 5.00 $ 25.00
32 Furnish and Install 1” Meter Box EA $ 2,500.00 $ 250.00 $ 950.00
33 Furnish and Install 1.5” Meter Box EA S 3,000.00 $ 275.00 S 1,000.00
34 Furnish and Install 2” Meter Box EA $ 3,500.00 $ 350.00 $ 1,050.00
35 Furnish and Install 3” Meter Box EA S 4,500.00 $ 400.00 S 1,200.00
36 Furnish and Install Sewer Clean Out Box EA $ 1,500.00 $ 300.00 $ 500.00
37 Furnish and Install Electrical/Street Lighting Lighting Box EA $ 1,500.00 $ 350.00 $ 500.00
Install 1” through 3” Meter Boxes, Cleanout Boxes,
38 Electrical Lighting Box (City will Furnish the Box) EA $ 800.00 $ 25.00 $ 100.00
39 Adjust Meter/Valve/Electrical box in sidewalk EA S 850.00 S 10.00 S 50.00
40 Remove and Re-install hand-Rails LF $ 1,200.00 $ 50.00 $ 500.00
Furnish and Install Pedestrian Hand Rails (Subsection
41 1.2.13) LF S 2,500.00 S 150.00 S 800.00
Concrete Flowable Fill. FDOT Spec 121. As directed by the
42 City Engineer. cY S 160.00 S 200.00 S 170.00
43 Remove and Reset Existing Fences LF S 30.00 $ 70.00 S 200.00




MILLING & RESURFACING OF ASPHALT CONCRETE

44 Rework Limerock Base +/- 3 inches CcY S 100.00 S 10.00 No Bid
45 Remove and replace 8 inch Limerock base cy S 400.00 S 25.00 No Bid
46 New Limerock 8 inch base CcY S 300.00 S 25.00 No Bid
47 FDOT Type S IIl - Asphalt Concrete TN S 250.00 S 170.00 No Bid
Superpave Asphalt Concrete SP-9.5. FDOT Specs 334. (1”
48 to 1.5” thickness) TN S 300.00 S 170.00 No Bid
Superpave Asphalt Concrete SP-12.5. FDOT Specs 334. (2”
49 to 2.5” thickness) TN S 350.00 S 170.00 No Bid
Friction Course Asphaltic Concrete FC-9.5. FDOT Specs
50 337. (1” thickness) TN S 250.00 S 170.00 No Bid
Friction Course Asphaltic Concrete FC-12.5. FDOT Specs
51 337. (1.5” thickness) TN S 350.00 S 170.00 No Bid
52 Adjust Valve Boxes EA S 250.00 S 200.00 No Bid
53 Adjust Manhole EA S 500.00 S 250.00 No Bid
54 Replace Manhole Rim and Cover EA S 1,000.00 S 700.00 No Bid
55 Replace Valve Box Cover/Riser EA S 1,000.00 S 400.00 No Bid
56 Replace Traffic Loops EA No Bid S 2,500.00 No Bid
57 Milling Existing Asphalt Concrete — 1” Cut SY S 3.00 S 2.00 No Bid
58 Milling Existing Asphalt Concrete — 1.5” Cut Sy S 3.50 S 2.25 No Bid
59 Milling Existing Asphalt Concrete —2” Cut SY S 4.00 S 3.00 No Bid
60 Milling Existing Asphalt Concrete —3” Cut Sy S 5.00 S 3.75 No Bid
61 Milling Existing Asphalt Concrete —4” Cut SY S 6.00 S 4.00 No Bid




STRIPING OF CITY STREETS

62 Thermoplastic 4” Solid Yellow/White LF S 2.50 S 1.50 No Bid
63 Paint 4” Solid Yellow/White LF S 1.80 S 1.00 No Bid
64 Thermoplastic 6” Solid White/Yellow LF S 3.20 S 2.00 No Bid
65 Paint 6” Solid Yellow/White LF S 2.80 S 1.50 No Bid
66 Thermoplastic 8” Solid White/Yellow LF S 2.80 S 2.25 No Bid
67 Paint 8” Solid Yellow/White LF S 1.90 S 1.75 No Bid
68 Thermoplastic 12” Solid White/Yellow LF S 3.50 S 2.75 No Bid
69 Paint 12” Solid Yellow/White LF S 2.50 S 2.00 No Bid
70 Thermoplastic 18” Solid White/Yellow LF S 4.50 S 4.00 No Bid
71 Paint 18” Solid Yellow/White LF S 3.00 S 2.50 No Bid
72 Thermoplastic 24” Solid White/Yellow LF S 5.50 S 5.50 No Bid
73 Paint 24” Solid Yellow/White LF S 3.50 S 3.00 No Bid
74 RPMs (Road Reflector) EA S 6.50 S 6.00 No Bid
75 Thermoplastic Arrows 14” (Std. MDC & FDOT Specs) EA S 200.00 S 300.00 No Bid
76 Paint Arrows 14” (Std. MDC & FDOT Specs) White EA S 150.00 S 100.00 No Bid
77 Thermoplastic Handicap Logo & Blue Stripe EA S 600.00 S 300.00 No Bid
78 Paint Handicap Logo & Blue Stripe EA S 350.00 S 100.00 No Bid
79 Removal of ALL Existing Thermo Striping (hydroblast) LF No Bid S 5.00 No Bid
80 Paint Bicycle Pavement Marking EA S 250.00 S 100.00 No Bid
81 Thermoplastic Bicycle Pavement Marking EA S 350.00 S 50.00 No Bid
82 Thermoplastic Messages (Bus/School) EA S 280.00 S 300.00 No Bid
83 Paint Messages EA S 200.00 S 150.00 No Bid
84 Installation of New Traffic Sign EA S 450.00 S 500.00 No Bid
85 Thermoplastic Stop Bars (12” Wide) LF S 4.50 S 5.50 No Bid
86 Stop Bars (12” Wide) White Paint LF S 3.50 S 3.00 No Bid
87 Thermoplastic Arrows 14” (Std. MDC & FDOT Specs) EA S 5.50 S 300.00 No Bid
88 Arrows 14” (Std. MDC & FDOT Specs) White Paint EA S 5.00 S 100.00 No Bid
89 Thermoplastic Cross Hatching (12”) LF S 4.50 S 2.75 No Bid
90 Cross Hatching (12”) White Paint LF S 3.50 S 2.00 No Bid
91 Thermoplastic Handicap Logo & Blue Stripe EA S 600.00 S 300.00 No Bid
92 Paint Handicap Logo & Blue Stripe EA S 530.00 S 100.00 No Bid
93 Thermoplastic Disable Cross Hatching (4”) EA S 3.50 S 100.00 No Bid
94 Disable Cross Hatching (4”) Paint EA S 2.50 S 100.00 No Bid
95 Furnish and Install Wheel Stop EA S 75.00 S 100.00 No Bid
96 Remove and Replace Wheel Stop EA S 100.00 S 100.00 No Bid
97 Installation of New Traffic Sign EA S 450.00 S 500.00 No Bid




PAINTING AND STRIPING OF GREEN BICYCLE LANES, RED-TRANSIT LANES, OTHER

COLORED PAVEMENT, STANDARD PAINT, AND SPECIAL MARKINGS

98 Permanent Green Paint Up to 10,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid
Permanent Green Paint 10,000 to 25,000 square feet of

99 Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid
Permanent Green Paint 25,000 to 50,000 square feet of

100 Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

101 Permanent Green Paint Above 50,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

102 Permanent Red Paint Up to 10,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid
Permanent Red Paint 10,000 to 25,000 square feet of

103 Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid
Permanent Red Paint 25,000 to 50,000 square feet of

104 Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

105 Permanent Red Paint Above 50,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

106 Permanent Other Paint Up to 10,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid
Permanent Other Paint 10,000 to 25,000 square feet of

107 Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid
Permanent Other Paint 25,000 to 50,000 square feet of

108 Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

109 Permanent Other Paint Above 50,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

110 Standard Paint Up to 10,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

111 Standard Paint 10,000 to 25,000 square feet of work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

112 Standard Paint 25,000 to 50,000 square feet of work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

113 Standard Paint Above 50,000 square feet of Work SF No Bid S 12.00 No Bid

114 Edge Line Marking SF No Bid S 3.00 No Bid

115 Standard Sharrow Symbol EA No Bid S 100.00 No Bid

116 Green Sharrow Symbol EA No Bid S 400.00 No Bid

117 Bike-only Lane Symbol EA No Bid S 100.00 No Bid

118 Bicycle Detector Symbol EA No Bid S 100.00 No Bid




119

LANE DELINEATORS

Zicla Zebra 13, or approved equal (see Special Conditions
#6)

EA

No Bid

130.00

No Bid

120

Zicla Zipper, or approved equal (see Special Conditions #6)

EA

No Bid

130.00

No Bid
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