
Black Oil Inc Indigo Energy 

Partners, LLC

Mansfield Oil 

Company of 

Gainesville Inc.

Saratoga Rack 

Marketing LLC

Sunoco LLC dba 

Gladieux Energy

Group A 

Item
Description

Annual Est. 

Qty 
U / M Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS

A1 Transport  delivery -Diesel 130,000 Gallons No Bid +0.0367 -0.0022
3

-0.0087
2

-0.0097
1

A2 Transport  delivery -Unleaded Gasoline 603,000 Gallons No Bid +0.0369 -0.0038
3

-0.0082
2

-0.0097
1

A3 Tank Wagon delivery- Diesel 8,400 Gallons  +0.0850
1

+0.1500
2 No Bid No Bid +0.3000

3

A4 Tank Wagon delivery- Unleaded Gasoline 8,400 Gallons +0.0900
1

+0.1500
2 No Bid No Bid +0.3000

3

A5 Truck delivery - Diesel 8,400 Gallons  No Bid +0.3050
1 No Bid No Bid +0.5000

2

A6 Truck delivery -Unleaded Gasoline 8,400 Gallons  No Bid +0.3050
1 No Bid No Bid +0.5000

2

Group B 

Item
Description

Annual Est. 

Qty 
U / M Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS Mark-Up over OPIS

B1 Pick Up of Diesel 15,500 Gallons +0.0750
1 No Bid No Bid No Bid +0.1500

2

B2 Pick Up of Gasoline 15,500 Gallons +0.0800
1 No Bid No Bid No Bid +0.1500

2

verify + and -

BID TABULATION SHEET

CITY OF MIAMI BEACH

 ITB NO. 2023-378-LB PICKUP AND DELIVERY OF UNLEADED GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

1
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2
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3
Tertiary
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