ITB 2022-113-ND Police and Fire
Department Uniform and
Accessories

ATTACHMENT B

Uniforms of
Miami Shores
LLC

Global

Galls. LLC ] Trading, Inc.

Municipal
Emergency
Services, Inc.

Soflo.Promo
Co

GROUP 1 - APPAREL

Percentage (%)  Percentage Percentage (%) Percentage (%) Percentage (%)
Discount (%) Discount Discount Discount Discount
1 .1 20% No Bid 35% No Bid 21%
2 JANCHOR 20% 15% O:A No Bid 20%
3 JAUGUSTA SPORTSWEAR 20% 15% 20% 15% 25%
4 IBIANCHI 20% 15% 20% 20% 20%
5 JBIMINI BAY CLOTHING 20% No Bid Olﬁw No Bid 21%
6 JIBLAUER No Bid 15% 15% 20% 21%
7 _JcoLuMBIA No Bid 15% 15% 18% 20%
8 JCORNERSTONE 20% 15% 20_% 18% 22%
9 JDICKIES 20% 15% 25_% 20% 25%
10 JEDWARDS 20% 15% 25% 20% 20%
11 JELBECO No Bid 15% 0% 20% 20%
12 JFLYING CROSS 20% 15% 12/0 3(2/9 20_%
13 JGILDAN 20% 15% 20_% 1&2% 22%
14 JHORACE SMALL 20% 15% 45_% 3‘2/0 22%
15 JLIBERTY CLOTHING 20% 15% 25% 15% 20%
16 _JMARLOW WHITE 20% 15% 0% No_Bid 20%
17 _JMOCEAN No Bid 15% 1(2’/0 20_% 20%
18 INEXT LEVEL 20% 15% 20_% 18_% 20_%
19 JOCCUNOMIX 20% 15% 20_% 20% 20%
20 JPINNACLE TEXTILE INDUSTRIES 20% 15% 45_% 20_% 25%
21 JPORT AND COMPANY 20% 15% 30_% 12& 20_%
22 JPORT AUTHORITY 20% 15% 45% 18% 22%
23 JPRO-TUFF 20% 15% 0% No Bid 20%
24 JRED KAP 20% 15% 30% 20% 227,
25 JSHIELD No Bid 15% 0:6 NO_Bid 20_%
26 §SPIEWAK No Bid 15% 25_% 20% 20%
27 JSPORT TEK 20% 15% 45% 20% 22%
28 JTRU SPEC 20% 15% 25% 30% 20%
29 JWATERMEN No Bid 15% 25% No Bid 20%
30 _JWORKRITE 20% 15% 15% 18% 22%




ATTACHMENT B

Uniforms of| Municipal
Miami Global Emergency
Shores LLC | Galls. LLC Trading, Inc. | Services, Inc. | Soflo.Promo Co

GROUP 2 - SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS AND SERVICES

Item Supplementary ltems and Services

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

One-time design of City logo $65.00 $50.00 No Charge No Charge $60.00
2 JEmbroidered City Logo Each $3.00 $5.50 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50
3 JEmbroidered City Badge Each $3.00 $11.65 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50
4 JAdditional Color Embroidered Item Each $3.00 $5.50 $6.00 $1.75 $3.00
5 JEmbroidered Flag Each $3.00 $7.96 $5.00 $5.00 $5.50
6 BEmbroidered Name Tape Each $5.00 $5.62 $5.00 $3.50 $5.50
7 JEmbroidered Employee Name Each $3.00 $3.00 $2.50 $3.50 $6.00
8 JEmbroidered Employee Rank Each $3.00 $3.50 $2.50 $3.50 $7.00
. IEmbrmdered City Department Name Each $10.00 $45.00 $12.50 $3.50 $11.00

lon Back
1 E?f;‘;ifr;?gﬁtéi‘zsanme”t Name Each $3.00 $5.50 $2.50 $7.00 $5.50
11 JAdditional Lines of Text Each $2.00 $3.00 $2.50 $3.50 $4.00
12 JSilk-Screened Logo Each $4.00 $5.40 $3.50 $2.00 $1.90
13 JSilk-Screened Employee Name Each $4.00 $5.40 $3.50 $2.00 $2.00
14 JSilk-Screened Employee Rank Each $3.00 $5.40 $3.50 $2.00 $1.90
15 Silk-Screened City Department Name Each $2.75 $5.40 $3.50 $2.00 $1.90
16 JSingle-Color Silk-Screened ltem Each $2.75 $4.50 $3.00 $2.00 $1.75
17 JTwo-Color Silk-Screened ltem Each $2.95 $5.40 $3.50 $2.25 $1.90
18 JThree-Color Silk-Screened ltem Each $2.75 $6.15 $3.50 $2.40 $2.25
19 JFour-Color Silk-Screened Item Each $2.75 $5.29 $4.00 $2.55 $2.50
20 JFull Back Flash Silk Screened Item Each $2.00 $5.15 $2.00 $2.85 $0.30
21 JReflective Safety Tape for Apparel Each $12.00 $15.01 $9.50 $5.00 $4.50
" IRgerctive Ink to Read Miami Beach Each $3.00 $15.26 $12.00 $7.25 $2.50

Fire Rescue
23 JPant Hems Each $5.50 $2.94 $2.50 $2.00 $10.00
24 [Tailoring Waist Each $7.00 $11.99 $25.00 $5.00 $16.00
25 QTailoring Inseam Each $7.00 $11.99 $10.00 $5.00 $20.00
26 [JTailoring Sleeve Length Each $7.00 $13.20 $5.00 $5.00 $20.00
27 JTailoring Neck Each $7.00 $11.99 $5.00 $8.00 $16.00
28 JSew on ltem Each $1.50 $2.80 $2.50 $2.00 $7.00
29 JEmbroidery of Stripe Each $3.00 $9.00 $4.00 $10.00 $5.00
30 §Embroidery of Additional Stripes Each $2.00 $9.00 $4.00 $10.00 $3.00




