
ATTACHMENT A

Group 1 - MB Magazine
2

Group 2 - Recreation Review 

Magazine

Group 3 - Summer Flyers

Group 4 - Pamphlets

Group 5 -  Renewal Letters or 

Other Notices
Group 6 - Postcards

Group 7 - Books and Reports

Group 8 - Postcards and Flyers

Group 9 - Brochures

Group 10 - Posters

Group 11 - Real Estate Signs
Group 12 - Miscellaneous Items

Corporate Graphics International, Inc.
1

No Bid

Doral Digital Reprographics Postal Center International, Inc.

$557,281.20 No Bid

No Bid $95,489.00 $113,827.30

No Bid $15,222.00 $3,003.00

No Bid $16,224.00 $12,212.00

No Bid $9,161.00 $3,544.00

$18,089.00 $3,812.00

No Bid $36,543.00 $28,318.18

PRINTING SERVICES

PRINTING AND BULK MAILING SERVICES

1Deemed non-responsive for or failure to submit Appendix A fully completed and executed.

$6,502.35 $10,759.00 $6,503.39

$13,400.25 $3,279.00 $4,866.00

$14,354.15 $6,617.00 $18,171.00

$58,570.85 $48,519.00 $43,276.00

No Bid

2 Not being recommended for award. The bid received exceeds cost expectations.

The Primary Awarded Bid amounts bolded and italicized indicate awarded amounts by group. 

$9,174.20 $6,883.00 $11,413.00


