

ITB 2018-112-ZD MBCC CLEANING EQUIPMENT												
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Quantity	Imperial Dade		Allied Paper Co.		Caldwell Cleaning, LLC		Supply Works		Rex Chemical, Corp.	
			Unit Prices	Extended Prices	Unit Prices	Extended Prices	Unit Prices	Extended Prices	Unit Prices	Extended Prices	Unit Prices	Extended Prices
1	Ride-On Carpet Extractor	1	\$ 17,462.40	\$ 17,462.40	\$ 14,528.65	\$ 14,528.65	\$ 11,353.39	\$ 11,353.39	\$ 12,029.65	\$ 12,029.65	\$ 17,757.42	\$ 17,757.42
2	Ride-On Vaccum	2	\$ 15,963.00	\$ 31,926.00	\$ 13,694.20	\$ 27,388.40	\$ 11,542.46	\$ 23,084.92	\$ 10,511.58	\$ 21,023.16	\$ 8,089.91	\$ 16,179.82
3	Walk-Behind Burnisher	4	\$ 8,318.00¹	\$33,720.00¹	\$ 8,814.77	\$ 35,259.08	\$ 5,746.57¹	\$ 22,986.28¹	\$ 5,477.44¹	\$ 21,909.76¹	\$ 3,999.55¹	\$ 15,998.20¹
4	Ride-On Burnisher	1	\$ 13,333.14	\$ 13,333.14	\$ 16,490.88	\$ 16,490.88	\$ 13,236.80	\$ 13,236.80	\$ 8,778.68¹	\$ 8,778.68¹	NO BID	NO BID
5	Floor Scrubber/Sweeper	2	\$ 72,088.05	\$ 144,176.10	\$ 63,222.81	\$ 126,445.62	\$ 39,166.30	\$ 78,332.60	\$ 55,951.03	\$ 111,902.06	NO BID	NO BID

Recommended for Award.

¹ Bid item did not meet specifications.