Arce, Mercy S (MIA - X22178)

From: McMillion, Jimmy <JimmyMcMillion@miamibeachfl.gov>
Sent: Monday, March 02, 2020 3:10 PM

To: Arce, Mercy S (MIA - X22178)

Cc: Hernandez, Carmen; Quezada, Ramon

Subject: PRR 20372

Attachments: PRR20372A.pdf

[External email]
Mercy:

The only BTR located of the requested properties is attached. It is expired now.

Carmen — Please close this request.



CITY OF MIAMI BEACH
CERTIFICATE OF USE, ANNUAL FIRE FEE, AND BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT

1700 Convention Center Drive
Miami Beach, Florida 33139-1819

TRADE NAME: BAY ROAD ANIMAL CLINIC OF MIAMI BEACH ,LC LICENSE NUMBER: RL-92163842
DBA: BAY ROAD ANIMAL CLINIC OF MIAMI BEACH ,LC Beginning:  08/20/2018

IN CARE OF: Expires: 09/30/2019
ADDRESS: 1730 Bay Rd Parcel No: 0232330120510

MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139-1414
TRADE ADDRESS: 1730 Bay Rd

A penalty is imposed for failure to keep this Business Tax Receipt Code

- : . Business Type
exhibited conspicuously at your place of business.

95020800 VETERINARIAN OR VETERINARY SURGEON
95006500 DOG GROOMING, ANIMAL CLINIC

A Business Tax Receipt issued under this article does not waive or

supersede other City laws, does not constitute City approval of a

particular business activity and does not excuse the licensee from all
other laws applicable to the licensee's business.

This Receipt may be transferred:

A. Within 30 days of a bonafide sale, otherwise a complete annual
payment is due.

B. To another location within the City if proper approvals and the
Additional Information

Storage Locations

FROM: CITY OF MIAMI BEACH
1700 CONVENTION CENTER DRIVE
PRESORTED
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139-1819 FIRST CLASS
U.S. POSTAGE
PAID

MIAMI BEACH, FL
PERMIT No 1525

BAY ROAD ANIMAL CLINIC OF MIAMI BEACH ,LC

1730 Bay Rd
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139-1414



Arce, Mercy S (MIA - X22178)

From: Hernandez, Carmen <CarmenHernandez@miamibeachfl.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 4:58 PM

To: Quezada, Ramon; Moya Denham, Maria; Goldberg, Morgan

Cc: Arce, Mercy S (MIA - X22178)

Subject: RE: City of Miami Beach - City Clerk Public Records Request System - PRR 20372

[External email]
Good afternoon please read below and add additional folio to the list.

Thank you,
Carmen

From: Mercy.Arce@hklaw.com <Mercy.Arce@hklaw.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 3:01 PM

To: Hernandez, Carmen <CarmenHernandez@ miamibeachfl.gov>

Cc: Public Research Requests <PublicResearchRequests@miamibeachfl.gov>
Subject: RE: City of Miami Beach - City Clerk Public Records Request System

[ THIS MESSAGE COMES FROM AN EXTERNAL EMAIL - USE CAUTION WHEN REPLYING AND OPENING LINKS OR
ATTACHMENTS ]

Hi Carmen,
Please add folio 02-3233-012-0480 to the request for PDFs of current and previously active Business Tax Receipts

Thank you,

Mercy Arce | Holland & Knight

Land Use Planner

Holland & Knight LLP

701 Brickell Avenue, Suite 3300 | Miami Florida 33131 Phone 305.349.2178 | Fax 305.789.7799 mercy.arce@hklaw.com
| www.hklaw.com

From: DoNotReply <DoNotReply@miamibeachfl.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 12:32 PM

To: Arce, Mercy S (MIA - X22178) <Mercy.Arce@hklaw.com>

Cc: Hernandez, Carmen <CarmenHernandez@miamibeachfl.gov>
Subject: City of Miami Beach - City Clerk Public Records Request System

[External email]

We are in receipt of your Public Records Request, and it has been forwarded to the following department(s) for
handling:



Finance

Information requested: Please provide PDFs of current and previously active Business Tax Receipts for the following
folios: 02-3233-012-0550 02-3233-012-0540 02-3233-012-0530 02-3233-012-0520 02-3233-012-0510 02-3233-012-0500
02-3233-012-0490

Please be advised that if the nature and/or volume of the public records requested to be inspected, examined or copied
requires extensive use of information technology resources and/or extensive clerical or supervisory assistance by City
personnel, you will be required to pay a service charge for the costs incurred for such extensive use of resources and/or
assistance. The City will charge 15 cents for each copy provided, as well as for extensive labor costs (labor exceeding 30
minutes) involved in the responding to the records request.

Note that your Public Records Request has been assigned PRR #20372 and IT PRR# (not applicable) .

Please reference said PRR # when communicating with the City regarding your request. If you have any questions, please
contact the Office of the City Clerk at (305) 673-7411 or researchrequest@miamibeachfl.gov .

NOTE: This e-mail is from a law firm, Holland & Knight LLP (“H&K”), and is intended solely for the use of the individual(s)
to whom it is addressed. If you believe you received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately, delete the
e-mail from your computer and do not copy or disclose it to anyone else. If you are not an existing client of H&K, do not
construe anything in this e-mail to make you a client unless it contains a specific statement to that effect and do not
disclose anything to H&K in reply that you expect it to hold in confidence. If you properly received this e-mail as a client,
co-counsel or retained expert of H&K, you should maintain its contents in confidence in order to preserve the attorney-
client or work product privilege that may be available to protect confidentiality.



