

Attachment A

ITB 2022-095-DF Ammunition

Tabulation

Group 1 - Frangible Rounds			
Item	Description	U/M	Est. Quantity
A1	380 ACP, minimum 75 grain; frangible lead free brass cartridge	Each Round	2,000
A2	38 Special, minimum 90 grain; frangible lead free brass	Each Round	2,000
A3 ¹	9mm; minimum 90 grain; frangible lead free cartridge	Each Round	325,000
A4 ²	40 S&W, minimum 124 grain; frangible lead free brass	Each Round	5,000
A5 ²	45 ACP, minimum 125 grain; frangible lead free brass cartridge	Each Round	4,000

Group 2 – Duty Rounds			
Item	Description	U/M	Est. Quantity
B1 ²	40 S&W; 165 grain jacketed hollow point bonded bullet or monolithic solid copper hollow point, nickel or brass case	Each Round	2,000
B2 ¹	9mm ; 124 Grain +P jacketed hollow point bonded bullet or monolithic solid copper hollow point, nickel or brass (GDHP or Sig Sauer)	Each Round	36,000
B3 ¹	223 Rem, FMJ; 62 grain jacketed hollow point bonded bullet or monolithic solid copper hollow point, nickel or brass case; Tactical Rifle Cartridge	Each Round	25,000

Ammo by Us Inc	
Unit Cost	Total (Quantity_X_Unit_Cost)
NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID
\$ 0.40	\$ 130,000.00
NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID

Unit Cost	Total (Quantity_X_Unit_Cost)
\$ 0.73	\$ 1,460.00
\$ 0.40	\$ 14,400.00
\$ 0.51	\$ 12,750.00

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc	
Unit Cost	Total (Quantity_X_Unit_Cost)
NO BID	NO BID
NO BID	NO BID
\$ 0.44	\$ 143,650.00
\$ 0.599	\$ 2,995.00
\$ 0.72	\$ 2,880.00

Unit Cost	Total (Quantity_X_Unit_Cost)
\$ 0.442	\$ 884.00
\$ 0.406	\$ 14,616.00
\$ 0.968	\$ 24,200.00

¹ Ammo by Us is recommended for award of line items A3, B2, and B3

² Lawmen's & Shooter's Supply is recommended for award of line items A4, A5, and B1