

Attachment A

Tabulation

| Group 1 - Pump Rental | | MWI Corporation | | | | Synergy Equipment | | | | Xylem Dewatering | | | |
|---------------------------------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|-------------------|------------|-------------|--------------|------------------|------------|-------------|--------------|
| Item | Description | Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate | Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate | Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate |
| 1 | 4" | NO BID | \$ 279.00 | \$ 761.00 | \$ 2,074.00 | NO BID | \$ 168.00 | \$ 561.00 | \$ 1,700.00 | \$ 156.00 | \$ 156.00 | \$ 468.00 | \$ 1,404.00 |
| 2 | 4" High Head | NO BID | \$ 314.00 | \$ 856.00 | \$ 2,333.00 | NO BID | \$ 208.00 | \$ 693.00 | \$ 2,100.00 | \$ 447.00 | \$ 447.00 | \$ 1,341.00 | \$ 4,023.00 |
| 3 | 6" | NO BID | \$ 382.00 | \$ 1,023.00 | \$ 2,788.00 | NO BID | \$ 228.00 | \$ 759.00 | \$ 2,300.00 | \$ 258.75 | \$ 258.75 | \$ 776.25 | \$ 2,328.75 |
| 4 | 6" High Head | NO BID | \$ 409.00 | \$ 1,093.00 | \$ 2,981.00 | NO BID | \$ 297.00 | \$ 990.00 | \$ 3,000.00 | \$ 579.75 | \$ 579.75 | \$ 1,739.25 | \$ 5,217.75 |
| 5 | 8" | NO BID | \$ 492.00 | \$ 1,316.00 | \$ 3,588.00 | NO BID | \$ 267.00 | \$ 891.00 | \$ 2,700.00 | \$ 347.25 | \$ 347.25 | \$ 1,041.75 | \$ 3,125.25 |
| 6 | 8" High Head | NO BID | \$ 1,210.00 | \$ 3,144.00 | \$ 8,200.00 | NO BID | \$ 347.00 | \$ 1,155.00 | \$ 3,500.00 | \$ 778.50 | \$ 778.50 | \$ 2,335.50 | \$ 7,006.50 |
| 7 | 10" | NO BID | \$ 993.00 | \$ 2,590.00 | \$ 6,757.00 | NO BID | \$ 396.00 | \$ 1,320.00 | \$ 4,000.00 | \$ 437.25 | \$ 437.25 | \$ 1,311.75 | \$ 3,935.25 |
| 8 | 10" High Head | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 426.00 | \$ 1,419.00 | \$ 4,300.00 | \$ 778.50 | \$ 778.50 | \$ 2,335.50 | \$ 7,006.50 |
| 9 | 12" | NO BID | \$ 1,084.00 | \$ 2,827.00 | \$ 7,374.00 | NO BID | \$ 495.00 | \$ 1,650.00 | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 513.00 | \$ 513.00 | \$ 1,539.00 | \$ 4,617.00 |
| 10 | 12" High Head | NO BID | \$ 1,479.00 | \$ 3,858.00 | \$ 10,063.00 | NO BID | \$ 545.00 | \$ 1,815.00 | \$ 5,500.00 | \$ 945.00 | \$ 945.00 | \$ 2,835.00 | \$ 8,505.00 |
| Group 2- Rental of Related Items | | Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate | Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate | Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate |
| Group 2A - Suction Hose | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 11 | 4" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 12.00 | \$ 29.00 | \$ 75.00 | NO BID | \$ 10.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 90.00 | \$ 7.20 | \$ 7.20 | \$ 21.60 | \$ 64.80 |
| 12 | 4" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 23.00 | \$ 58.00 | \$ 150.00 | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 45.00 | \$ 135.00 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 | \$ 113.40 |
| 13 | 6" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 39.00 | \$ 100.00 | NO BID | \$ 10.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 90.00 | \$ 11.40 | \$ 11.40 | \$ 34.20 | \$ 102.60 |
| 14 | 6" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 30.00 | \$ 77.00 | \$ 200.00 | NO BID | \$ 17.00 | \$ 53.00 | \$ 160.00 | \$ 17.40 | \$ 17.40 | \$ 52.20 | \$ 156.60 |
| 15 | 8" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 20.00 | \$ 49.00 | \$ 125.00 | NO BID | \$ 13.00 | \$ 40.00 | \$ 120.00 | \$ 19.80 | \$ 19.80 | \$ 59.40 | \$ 178.20 |
| 16 | 8" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 37.00 | \$ 96.00 | \$ 250.00 | NO BID | \$ 22.00 | \$ 66.00 | \$ 200.00 | \$ 31.20 | \$ 31.20 | \$ 93.60 | \$ 280.80 |
| 17 | 10" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 30.00 | \$ 77.00 | \$ 200.00 | NO BID | \$ 16.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 150.00 | \$ 24.00 | \$ 24.00 | \$ 72.00 | \$ 216.00 |
| 18 | 10" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 60.00 | \$ 154.00 | \$ 400.00 | NO BID | \$ 27.00 | \$ 83.00 | \$ 250.00 | \$ 46.80 | \$ 46.80 | \$ 140.40 | \$ 421.20 |
| 19 | 12" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 40.00 | \$ 106.00 | \$ 275.00 | NO BID | \$ 22.00 | \$ 66.00 | \$ 200.00 | \$ 31.80 | \$ 31.80 | \$ 95.40 | \$ 286.20 |
| 20 | 12" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 81.00 | \$ 211.00 | \$ 550.00 | NO BID | \$ 33.00 | \$ 99.00 | \$ 300.00 | \$ 54.00 | \$ 54.00 | \$ 162.00 | \$ 486.00 |
| Group 2B - Suction End Protection Screen (Strainer) | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 21 | 4" | NO BID | \$ 6.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$ 25.00 | NO BID | \$ 4.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$ 36.00 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 |
| 22 | 6" | NO BID | \$ 7.00 | \$ 15.00 | \$ 35.00 | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 14.40 | \$ 43.20 |
| 23 | 8" | NO BID | \$ 10.00 | \$ 20.00 | \$ 40.00 | NO BID | \$ 7.00 | \$ 20.00 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 48.60 |
| 24 | 10" | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 35.00 | \$ 90.00 | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 75.00 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 23.40 | \$ 70.20 |
| 25 | 12" | NO BID | \$ 20.00 | \$ 49.00 | \$ 125.00 | NO BID | \$ 9.00 | \$ 28.00 | \$ 85.00 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 25.20 | \$ 75.60 |
| Group 2C - Tee Float Section End | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 26 | 4" | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 75.00 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 |
| 27 | 6" | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 14.40 | \$ 43.20 |
| 28 | 8" | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 14.00 | \$ 41.00 | \$ 125.00 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 48.60 |
| 29 | 10" | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 16.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 150.00 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 23.40 | \$ 70.20 |
| 30 | 12" | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 19.00 | \$ 58.00 | \$ 175.00 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 25.20 | \$ 75.60 |
| Group 2D - Polypropylene Discharge Hose (up to 150 psi) | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 31 | 4" 10' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 4.00 | \$ 13.00 | \$ 40.00 | \$ 15.00 | \$ 15.00 | \$ 22.50 | \$ 45.00 |
| 32 | 4" 20' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 7.00 | \$ 20.00 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 90.00 |
| 33 | 6" 10' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 18.30 | \$ 18.30 | \$ 27.50 | \$ 55.00 |
| 34 | 6" 20' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 9.00 | \$ 26.00 | \$ 80.00 | \$ 36.66 | \$ 36.66 | \$ 55.00 | \$ 110.00 |
| 35 | 8" 10' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 7.00 | \$ 20.00 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 21.66 | \$ 21.66 | \$ 32.50 | \$ 65.00 |
| 36 | 8" 20' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 160.00 | \$ 43.33 | \$ 43.33 | \$ 65.00 | \$ 65.00 |
| 37 | 10" 10' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 23.00 | \$ 70.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 75.00 |
| 38 | 10" 20' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 13.00 | \$ 40.00 | \$ 120.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 75.00 | \$ 150.00 |
| 39 | 12" 10' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 28.33 | \$ 28.33 | \$ 42.50 | \$ 85.00 |
| 40 | 12" 20' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 17.00 | \$ 53.00 | \$ 160.00 | \$ 56.60 | \$ 56.60 | \$ 85.00 | \$ 170.00 |
| Group 2E - Layflat Hose | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 41 | 4" 50' Section | NO BID | \$ 25.00 | \$ 59.00 | \$ 150.00 | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 45.00 | \$ 135.00 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 | \$ 113.40 |
| 42 | 4" 100' Section | NO BID | \$ 39.00 | \$ 99.00 | \$ 250.00 | NO BID | \$ 29.00 | \$ 89.00 | \$ 270.00 | \$ 24.60 | \$ 24.60 | \$ 73.80 | \$ 221.40 |
| 43 | 6" 50' Section | NO BID | \$ 30.00 | \$ 89.00 | \$ 225.00 | NO BID | \$ 17.00 | \$ 53.00 | \$ 160.00 | \$ 20.40 | \$ 20.40 | \$ 61.20 | \$ 183.60 |
| 44 | 6" 100' Section | NO BID | \$ 60.00 | \$ 145.00 | \$ 375.00 | NO BID | \$ 35.00 | \$ 106.00 | \$ 320.00 | \$ 39.00 | \$ 39.00 | \$ 117.00 | \$ 351.00 |
| 45 | 8" 50' Section | NO BID | \$ 45.00 | \$ 110.00 | \$ 275.00 | NO BID | \$ 22.00 | \$ 66.00 | \$ 200.00 | \$ 49.80 | \$ 49.80 | \$ 149.40 | \$ 448.20 |
| 46 | 8" 100' Section | NO BID | \$ 72.00 | \$ 173.00 | \$ 450.00 | NO BID | \$ 44.00 | \$ 132.00 | \$ 400.00 | \$ 93.00 | \$ 93.00 | \$ 279.00 | \$ 837.00 |

Attachment A

| | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------------------------------|------------------|-----------|-----------|-----------|------------------|----------|-----------|-----------|------------------|----------|-----------|-----------|
| 47 | 10" 50' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 27.00 | \$ 83.00 | \$ 250.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| 48 | 10" 100' Section | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 54.00 | \$ 165.00 | \$ 500.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| 49 | 12" 50' Section | NO BID | \$ 85.00 | \$ 211.00 | \$ 550.00 | NO BID | \$ 33.00 | \$ 99.00 | \$ 300.00 | \$ 79.80 | \$ 79.80 | \$ 239.40 | \$ 718.20 |
| 50 | 12" 100' Section | NO BID | \$ 140.00 | \$ 365.00 | \$ 950.00 | NO BID | \$ 65.00 | \$ 198.00 | \$ 600.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Group 2F - Bauer-Style Hard Pipe with Locking Connections | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 51 | 4" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 12.00 | \$ 29.00 | \$ 75.00 | NO BID | \$ 4.00 | \$ 13.00 | \$ 40.00 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 48.60 |
| 52 | 4" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 23.00 | \$ 58.00 | \$ 150.00 | NO BID | \$ 7.00 | \$ 20.00 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 6.60 | \$ 6.60 | \$ 19.80 | \$ 59.40 |
| 53 | 6" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 39.00 | \$ 100.00 | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 6.00 | \$ 6.00 | \$ 18.00 | \$ 54.00 |
| 54 | 6" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 30.00 | \$ 77.00 | \$ 200.00 | NO BID | \$ 9.00 | \$ 26.00 | \$ 80.00 | \$ 13.00 | \$ 13.00 | \$ 39.00 | \$ 117.00 |
| 55 | 8" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 20.00 | \$ 49.00 | \$ 125.00 | NO BID | \$ 7.00 | \$ 26.00 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 6.60 | \$ 6.60 | \$ 19.80 | \$ 59.40 |
| 56 | 8" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 37.00 | \$ 96.00 | \$ 250.00 | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 11.40 | \$ 11.40 | \$ 34.20 | \$ 102.60 |
| 57 | 10" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 30.00 | \$ 77.00 | \$ 200.00 | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 23.00 | \$ 70.00 | \$ 6.60 | \$ 6.60 | \$ 19.80 | \$ 59.40 |
| 58 | 10" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 60.00 | \$ 154.00 | \$ 400.00 | NO BID | \$ 13.00 | \$ 40.00 | \$ 120.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| 59 | 12" 10' Section | NO BID | \$ 40.00 | \$ 106.00 | \$ 275.00 | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 7.20 | \$ 7.20 | \$ 21.60 | \$ 64.80 |
| 60 | 12" 20' Section | NO BID | \$ 81.00 | \$ 211.00 | \$ 550.00 | NO BID | \$ 17.00 | \$ 53.00 | \$ 160.00 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |
| Group 2G - 45 Degree Bend/Elbow | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 61 | 4" | NO BID | \$ 10.00 | \$ 24.00 | \$ 59.00 | NO BID | \$ 4.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$ 35.00 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 |
| 62 | 6" | NO BID | \$ 12.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 75.00 | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 14.40 | \$ 43.20 |
| 63 | 8" | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 81.00 | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 75.00 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 48.60 |
| 64 | 10" | NO BID | \$ 31.00 | \$ 73.00 | \$ 145.00 | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 23.40 | \$ 70.20 |
| 65 | 12" | NO BID | \$ 27.00 | \$ 66.00 | \$ 165.00 | NO BID | \$ 14.00 | \$ 41.00 | \$ 125.00 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 25.20 | \$ 75.60 |
| Group 2H - 90 Degree Bend/Elbow | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 66 | 4" | NO BID | \$ 10.00 | \$ 24.00 | \$ 59.00 | NO BID | \$ 4.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$ 35.00 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 |
| 67 | 6" | NO BID | \$ 12.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 75.00 | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 14.40 | \$ 43.20 |
| 68 | 8" | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 81.00 | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 75.00 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 48.60 |
| 69 | 10" | NO BID | \$ 29.00 | \$ 72.00 | \$ 145.00 | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 23.40 | \$ 70.20 |
| 70 | 12" | NO BID | \$ 33.00 | \$ 82.00 | \$ 165.00 | NO BID | \$ 14.00 | \$ 41.00 | \$ 125.00 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 25.20 | \$ 75.60 |
| Group 2I - Baur-Style Wye Connection | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 71 | 4" | NO BID | \$ 10.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 65.00 | NO BID | \$ 4.00 | \$ 12.00 | \$ 35.00 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 4.20 | \$ 12.60 | \$ 37.80 |
| 72 | 6" | NO BID | \$ 12.00 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 75.00 | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 4.80 | \$ 14.40 | \$ 43.20 |
| 73 | 8" | NO BID | \$ 20.00 | \$ 49.00 | \$ 125.00 | NO BID | \$ 8.00 | \$ 25.00 | \$ 75.00 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 5.40 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 48.60 |
| 74 | 10" | NO BID | \$ 28.00 | \$ 77.00 | \$ 160.00 | NO BID | \$ 11.00 | \$ 33.00 | \$ 100.00 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 7.80 | \$ 23.40 | \$ 70.20 |
| 75 | 12" | NO BID | \$ 35.00 | \$ 88.00 | \$ 185.00 | NO BID | \$ 14.00 | \$ 41.00 | \$ 125.00 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 8.40 | \$ 25.20 | \$ 75.60 |
| Group 2J - Float Switch Level Sensor | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 76 | Float Switch Level Sensor | NO BID | \$ 32.00 | \$ 79.00 | \$ 200.00 | NO BID | \$ 27.00 | \$ 83.00 | \$ 250.00 | \$ 33.40 | \$ 33.40 | \$ 100.20 | \$ 300.60 |
| Group 2k - Road/Hose Ramps | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 77 | Road/Hose Ramps | NO BID | \$ 55.00 | \$ 135.00 | \$ 350.00 | NO BID | \$ 93.00 | \$ 281.00 | \$ 850.00 | \$ 40.20 | \$ 40.20 | \$ 120.60 | \$ 361.80 |
| Group 2L - 6" x 4" Connection Reducing Adapter | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 78 | 6" x 4" Connection Reducing Adapter | NO BID | \$ 15.00 | \$ 29.00 | \$ 75.00 | NO BID | \$ 5.00 | \$ 17.00 | \$ 50.00 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 16.20 | \$ 24.30 | \$ 48.60 |
| Group 3 - Emergency Technical Services | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Item | Description | Unit Cost | | | | Unit Cost | | | | Unit Cost | | | |
| 1 | Emergency Labor Rate | \$ | | 150.00 | \$ | | 135.00 | \$ | | 110.00 | | | |